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Re: Amber Frerichs
1 message

Brandi Hollenbeck <bhollenbeck@rockeountyschools.org> Fri, Aug 18, 2017 at 2:13 PM
To: Jan Fosler <janfoster@esui7.org>

Cc: Jimamholt <jimarnholt@gmaill.com?, John Dehrman <jdohrman@rockeountyschools.org®>, Teresa Wiiest <hvilestirockcountyschaols.org>, Timothy Shaw
<Bmpgshaw@abbnebraska.com>

| think this is a great idea! 1 will make the moticn o7 whalever ! need 1o dol
Thanks, Brandl

On Fi, Aug 18, 2017 at 2:07 PM, Jan Foster <janfoster@esui?.org> wrote:
Happy Friday afternoonl
| have made contact with representatives of the James & Lena Brown, Ford Garwood, Terry Family and the Lincoln Community Foundation - Sam Jacebitz
scholarship funds. Amber Frerichs would have been awarded her 4th year scholarship montes from these funds this year. Each of them has agreed 1o allow the
money ($1300.00 total) {o be iransferred {o the newly established Amber Frerichs Memorial Scholarship fund.

. Are all of you In agreement with this? 1 think it Is a very nice tribute to Amber and her family. We can also hotd off and vole on this at our next meeting if you think
that would be better.
Thanks,
Jan

Jan Foster

ESU 17 Business Manager
Phone: 402-387-1420
Fax: 402-387-1028

Brandi Hollenbeck

Rock County Public Schools
Administrative Assistant
£.0. Box 448

Bassetit, NE G8714

N 402-684-3411
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lofl 8/22/17, 12:14 PM
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Re: Amber Frerichs
1 message

Tim Shavws <timpgshaw@abbnebraska.com> Fri, Aug i8, 2017 at 6:59 PM
To: Brandi Hollenback <bholienbeck@rockcountyschools.org>

Cc: Jan Foster <janfoster@esu17.0rg>, jimamholt <jimamholtl@gmail.ccm®>, John Dohrman <jdohrman@rockeountyschoals.org>, Teresa Wiiest
<twilesi@rockcountyschools.org>

Yes, great ideal 1 second the molion.
Tim
Sentfrem my IPad

Cn Aug 18, 2017, al 2:13 PM, Brandi Hellenbeck <bhollenteck@rockeountyschools.org> wrote:

1 think this is & great ideal | will make the motion or whatever | need {o dol
Thanks, Brandi

On Fri, Aug 18, 2017 at 2:07 PM, Jan Foster <janfoster@esul17.org> wiole:
| Happy Friday afternoon!
[ have made contact with representativas of the James & Lena Brown, Ford Ganvood, Terry Family and the Lincoln Community Foundation - Sam Jacobitz
" scholarship funds, Amber Fresichs would have been awarded her 4th year scholarship montes from these funds this year. Each of them has agreed to allow the
' money ($1300.00 total) to be transferred to the newly established Amber Frerichs Memorial Scholarship fund.
© Are ail of you in agreement with this? [ think it is a very nice tribute to Amber and her family. We can also hold off and vate on this at our next meeting if you
i think that would be belter.
; Thanks,
T Jan
]

i Jan Fosler
| ESU 17 Business Manager
i Phone: 402-387-1420

. Fax: 402.387-1028

Brandl Hollenback

Rock County Public Schools
Administrative Assistant
P.O. Box 448

Bassett, NE 68714
402-684-3411

8/22/17, 12:15PM
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Re: Amber Frerichs
1 message

John Dohrman <jdohrman@rockeountyschools.crg> Fri, Aug 18, 2017 at 2:15 PM

To: Jan Foster <janfoster@esui?.org>

| think that Is .grea't and would be in favor of.

On Fr, Aug 18, 2017 at 2:07 PM, Jan Foster <janfoster@esui?.omg> wrole:
Happy Friday afternocnt
| have made contact with representatives of the James & Lena Brown, Ford Garwood, Terry Family and the Lincoln Community Foundation - Sam Jacobitz
scholarship funds, Amber Frerichs would have been awarded her 4th year scholarship monies from these funds this year. Each of them has agreed to allow the
money {$1300.00 total) to be iransferred to the newly eslablished Amber Frerichs Memorial Scholarship fund.
Are all of yau in agreement with this? | think it 1s & very nice tribule to Amber and ker family. We can also hold off and vote on this at our next meeting if you think
that would be betler.
Thanks,
Jan

Jan Fosler

E8SU 17 Business Manager
Phone: 462-387 1420

Fax: 402-387-1028
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Re: Amber Frerichs
1 message

twHest@rockcountyschools.org <twilest@rockeountyschools.org> Fri, Aug 18, 2017 at 7:35 PM

To: Tim Shaw <timpgshaw@abbnebraska.com>
Ce¢; Brandi Hollanback <bholienbeck@rockcountyschools.org>, Jan Foster <janfoster@esu17.org>, jimamhelt <jimamholt@gmail.com>, John Dohrman

<jdehrman@rockcountyschools.crg>

Great ideal Yes!
Teresa

On Aug 18, 2017, at 6:59 PM, Tim Shaw <timpgshaw@abbnebraske.com> wrote:

Yes, great ideal 1 second the motion.
Tim
Sent from my iPad

On Aug 18, 2017, at 2:13 PM, Brandi Hollenbeck <bhoilznback@rockcountyschaols.org> wrole:

| think this Is a great ideal | wil! make the motion or whatever | nead to do!
Thanks, Brandi

QOn Fri, Aug 18, 2017 at 2:07 PM, Jan Foster <janfoster@esui7.org> wrole:
. Happy Friday aftemcon!
i | have made contact with representatives of the James & Lena Brown, Ford Ganvood, Terry Famity and the Lingeln Community Foundation - Sam Jacobitz
; scholarship funds, Amber Frerichs would have been awarded her 4th year scholarship monles from these funds this year. Each of them has agreed fo allow
- the money ($1300.00 total) to be transferred to the newly established Amber Frerichs Memorial Schelarship fund.
, Are all of you In agreement vith this? | think it Is a very nice iribute to Amber and her family. We can also hold off and vote on this at our next meeting if you
ihink that would be better,
! Thanks,
]
;Jan
i Jan Foster
! ESU 17 Businoss Manager
| Phone: 402-367-1420
; Fax: 432-387-1028

Brandi Hollenback

Rock County Public Schools
Administrative Assistant
P.0. Box 448

Bassett, NE 68714
402-684-3411

8/22/17, 12:15 PM
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Re: Amber Frerichs
1 message

Jim Araholt <jimarnholt@gmail.com> Fri, Aug 18, 2017 2t 8:37 PM

To: Jan Foster <janfoster@esuir.crg>

Reger that, Matlon camied 5%

On Aug 18, 2017 8:08 PM, "Jan Foster” <izrfosler@asul7.org> wrota:
Tim made a second. Sol think we are geod!

Sent from my iPad

On Aug 18, 2017, at 7:16 PM, Jim Archelt <jmarnholi@gmail.com=> wiote:

Woops, sorry, guess F'm pres so not sposed to 2nd. Let me knaw if some does. Then motion carded unless somecne wants further discusston.

On Aug 18, 2017 2:.07 PM, "Jan Fosler” <iznfosler@@esu17.oro> wrote:

Happy Friday afternoon!
] have made contact with representatives of the James & Lena Brown, Ford Ganwood, Terry Famity and the Lincoln Community Foundation - Sam Jacobliz

scholarship funds. Amber Frerichs would have baen awarded har 4th yaar scholarship monles from these funds this year. Each of them has agreed to allow
the money {$1300.00 total} to be transferred to the newiy eslablished Ambar Frerichs Memorial Scholarship fund.

Are all of you in agreement wilh this? | think it is a very nice tibute to Amber and her family. We can also hold off and vota on this at our next meeting if you
think that would be better.

Thanks,

Jan

Jan Foster

ESU 17 Business Manager
Phona: 4023871423
Fax: 402-387-1028
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